
         DEMOLITION BID  TABULATION
Specification Number: C968000002                                                                                                                                                                   Date: January 24, 2000

Project Description: Request for Demolition Services Fast Track & Court Ordered Class “D” Demolition Bids

Bid Deposit: $    NONE                                                                                      Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                                                                Contract Administrator: J. Moll  

NAME OF BIDDER
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MMT
Demolition

Anrab One
Inc.

C & L
Demolition

Delta
Demolition

Oak Park
Inc.

A Wrecking Certified
Wrecking

Cab Tech
Corp.

J.F. Hauling ACS Inc.

325 W. 48 Pl. NO BID $4,120.00 $9,600.00 NO BID $5,600.00 $4,200.00 $8,790.00 $8,500.00 $8,900.00 $6,234.00

1314 W. 73 St. NO BID $4,700.00 $6,200.00 NO BID $6,000.00 $6,700.00 $7,149.00 $6,275.00 $8,700.00 $6,234.00

28 E. 100 St. NO BID $4,200.00 $6,200.00 NO BID $5,200.00 $6,700.00 $4,349.00 $6,250.00 $7,500.00 $5,734.00

1426 W. 105 Pl. NO BID $4,400.00 $6,200.00 NO BID $6,000.00 $7,700.00 $9,640.00 $6,170.00 NO BID $5,734.00

12 E. 113 St. NO BID $8,860.00 NO BID $9,500.00 $15,000.00 $5,849.00 $8,100.00 $7,000.00 NO BID

13 E. 113 St. NO BID $8,860.00 $18,000.00 NO BID $6,000.00 $15,000.00 $3,749.00 $5,800.00 $5,500.00 NO BID

68 W. 113 St. NO BID $6,080.00 $9,800.00 NO BID $9,999.00 $8,700.00 $5,849.00 $8,490.00 $8,700.00 $8,734.00

23 W. 124 St. NO BID $4,960.00 $9,700.00 NO BID NO BID $7,700.00 $9,250.00 $8,900.00 NO BID $5,734.00

11357 S. Eggleston NO BID NO BID $9,800.00 NO BID $8,500.00 $6,900.00 $9,149.00 $8,890.00 NO BID $6,734.00

6238 S. Hermitage $9,450.00 $4,000.00 $8,900.00 NO BID $5,800.00 $9,700.00 NO BID $8,950.00 NO BID $12,934.00

7532 S. Honore NO BID $6,200.00 $6,600.00 NO BID $5,800.00 $9,500.00 $7,990.00 $6,290.00 NO BID $8,734.00

3518 W. Lexington $8,000.00 $15,000.00 $8,900.00 NO BID $6,500.00 $7,600.00 $9,640.00 $8,950.00 NO BID $12,234.00

22 N. Mayfield $9,900.00 NO BID $9,600.00 NO BID $6,500.00 $9,500.00 NO BID $8,900.00 NO BID NO BID

1442 S. Ridgeway $7,800.00 $15,000.00 $8,900.00 NO BID $6,000.00 $9,800.00 $8,900.00 $9,300.00 NO BID $12,234.00

5412 S. Shields NO BID $4,360.00 $6,000.00 NO BID $6,200.00 $11,000.00 $7,840.00 $6,750.00 $9,500.00 $8,734.00

1944 S. Trumball $5,800.00 $12,000.00 $8,800.00 NO BID $6,000.00 $9,900.00 NO BID $8,950.00 NO BID NO BID

5211 S. Wolcott $7,450.00 $4,860.00 $8,800.00 NO BID $6,400.00 $9,800.00 NO BID $8,925.00 NO BID $6,734.00

1029 N. Avers $4,800.00 NO BID $8,400.00 NO BID $6,500.00 $9,800.00 NO BID $9,500.00 NO BID NO BID

2948 E. 80th Pl. NO BID $4,380.00 $8,200.00 NO BID $6,000.00 $9,500.00 NO BID $6,875.00  NO BID NO BID

244 W. 104th Pl. NO BID $3,960.00 $7,400.00 NO BID $5,000.00 $9,500.00 $3,898.00 $6,300.00 $8,700.00 $5,734.00



         DEMOLITION BID  TABULATION
Specification Number: C968000002                                                                                                                                                                   Date: January 24, 2000

Project Description: Request for Demolition Services Fast Track & Court Ordered Class “D” Demolition Bids

Bid Deposit: $    NONE                                                                                      Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                                                                Contract Administrator: J. Moll  

Bids are subject to review for completeness accuracy and compliance with all the terms and conditions provided in the bid specifications .  
City of Chicago, Richard M. Daley, Mayor 
Department of Purchases, Contracts & Supplies, Alexander Grzyb, Acting-Purchasing Agent
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7319 S. Aberdeen St. NO BID $6,080.00 $7,200.00 NO BID $8,000.00 $9,500.00 NO BID $6,880.00 $6,800.00 $12,134.00

1412 S. Ashland Ave. $8,950.00 NO BID $22,000.00 NO BID $6,000.00 $4,200.00 $12,440.00 NO BID NO BID $8,334.00

3056 N. Avers Ave. NO BID $18,000.00 $9,900.00 NO BID $10,900.00 $11,000.00 NO BID $9,275.00 $9,300.00 NO BID

5023 S. Elizabeth Ave. NO BID $7,500.00 $6,200.00 NO BID $6,300.00 $9,500.00 $6,340.00 $6,570.00 $6,500.00 $6,234.00

1834 S. Komensky Ave. $5,000.00 $3,880.00 $8,800.00 NO BID $6,200.00 $9,500.00 NO BID $8,950.00 NO BID $8,734.00

163 N. LaCrosse Ave. $6,000.00 NO BID $8,600.00 NO BID $7,500.00 $11,000.00 NO BID $8,925.00 NO BID NO BID

330 S. Mozart St. $5,000.00 $3,880.00 $9,400.00 NO BID $8,000.00 $12,000.00 NO BID $8,750.00 NO BID NO BID

5419 W. Thomas St. $9,900.00 $6,900.00 $7,400.00 NO BID $6,000.00 $11,000.00 $6,840.00 $7,850.00 $6,500.00 NO BID

                      


