

SALVAGE TABULATION



REVISED 7-31-02 AT 3:11PM

Specification Number:F2998940011

Date: July 31, 2002

Project Description: USED VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: \$ NONE

Addendum 1 2 3 4

Contract Administrator: J. Picl

NAME OF BIDDER	PG. 1	M. Haghanegi	Andy's Truck & Equip., Co.	Derby Hill Equipment	Adelman's Truck Parts Corp.	A-1 Services	WH&SI	Airline Towing Ser.	Richards Auto Sales	Alfredo Jiminez	Ideal Auto Ent. Inc.	Vintage Vehicles & Parts	Craig Hanson
1) FDA374		X	X	NO BID	X	\$710.10	NO BID	X	NO BID	NO BID	\$1,269.00	NO BID	X
2) FDA386		X	X		X	\$1,765.10		X			\$569.00		X
3) FDD433		X	\$769.00		\$1,288.00	X		X			X		X
4) FDD465		X	\$929.00		\$1,288.00	X		X			X		X
5) FDD467		X	\$919.00		\$1,433.00	X		X			X		X
6) FDD474		X	\$869.00		\$1,157.00	X		X			X		X
7) FDD477		X	\$879.00		\$908.00	X		X			X		X
8) FDE182		X	\$489.00		\$366.00	X		X			X		X
9) FDE194		X	\$429.00		\$206.00	X		\$1,000.00			X		\$2,753.51
10) FDE198		X	\$529.00		\$288.00	X		X			X		X
11) FDE201		X	\$619.00		\$288.00	X		\$1,000.00			X		X
12) FDE206		X	\$589.00		\$366.00	X		\$1,000.00			X		X
13) FDE217		X	\$629.00		\$309.00	X		X			X		X
14) FMO111		X	X		X	X		X			X		X
15) FM2104		X	X		X	X		X			X		X
16) PV0112		X	X		X	\$355.10		X			\$1,269.00		X
17) S14406		X	X		X	X		X			\$129.00		X
18) S14451		X	X		X	X		X			X		X

SALVAGE TABULATION



REVISED 7-31-02 AT 3:11PM

Specification Number:F2998940011

Date: July 31, 2002

Project Description: USED VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: \$ NONE

Addendum 1 2 3 4

Contract Administrator: J. Picl

NAME OF BIDDER	PG. 4	Erickson Trucks-N-Parts	Saeed Auto Sales	Paul McKinley									
17) S14406		X	X	X									
18) S14451		X	X	X									
19) FDC963		\$927.11	\$179.77	X									
20) FDC892		\$627.11	\$179.77	X									

Bids are subject to review for completeness accuracy and compliance with all the terms and conditions provided in the bid specifications.

City of Chicago
Richard M. Daley, Mayor

Department of Procurement Services
David E. Malone Chief Procurement Officer