Specification Number: F2998940022

Project Description: USED VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: $ NONE

SALVAGE TABULATION

Addendum 1 2 3 4

Date: November 25, 2002

Contract Administrator: J. Picl

NAME OF BIDDER PG.1 Adelman’s Action Iron Al Witvoet Richards CircleR Auto Paco’s Derby Hill Mr.D’s Michael Erickson North
Truck Parts & Metal Auto Sales Farms Wholesalers | McCoy Auto Equipment Towing & O’ Nseill Truck-N- Shore
Corp. Pgrlgsg Auto Sales Parts Recycling
1) FDD473 X $600.00 X NO BID X NO BID X X X X $1,131.77 $467.00
2) FDD409 $678.00 $600.00 X X X X X X $511.77 $469.00
3) FDD452 $738.00 $600.00 X X X X X X $611.77 $469.00
4) FDD485 X $600.00 X X X X X X $311.77 $150.00
5) FDD486 $688.00 $600.00 X X X X X X $616.77 $479.00
6) FDE179 $308.00 X X X X X X X $1,131.77 $402.00
7) FDE261 X X X X X X X X $1,307.77 $505.00
8) 12307 $1,131.00 $805.00 $525.00 X X X $1,251.00 X $611.77 $200.00
9) 10078 X $805.00 $1,550.00 $1,100.00 $50.00 $3,159.00 X X $3,651.77 $1,508.00
10) 10079 X $805.00 $1,250.00 $1,100.00 $50.00 $2,769.00 X X $2,631.77 $500.00
11) 10080 $1,671.00 X $875.00 X X X X X $1,777.77 $903.00
12) 10081 $1,671.00 X $865.00 X X X X X $1,331.77 $807.00
13) 10082 $1,031.00 X $725.00 X X X X X $861.77 $709.00
14) 12039 $1,252.00 X $925.00 X X $658.00 X X $1,831.77 $108.00
15) 12042 $1,128.00 X X X X $658.00 X X $1,631.77 $109.00
16) 12052 $1,387.00 X $1,125.00 X X $258.00 X X $2,831.77 $110.00
17) 12056 X X X X X X X X $411.77 $105.00




Specification Number: F2998940022

Project Description: USED VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: $ NONE

Addendum 1 2 3 4

SALVAGE TABULATION

Date: November 25, 2002

Contract Administrator: J. Picl

NAME OF BIDDER PG.2 Adelman’s Action Iron Al Witvoet Richards CircleR Auto Paco’s Derby Hill Mr.D’s Michael Erickson North
Truck Parts & Metal Auto Sales Farms Wholesalers | McCoy Auto Equipment Towing & O’ Nseill Truck-N- Shore
Corp. Pgrlgsg Auto Sales Parts Recycling
18) 12058 $1,331.00 X X NO BID NO BID X $658.00 X X $3,257.77 $507.00
19) 12060 $1,331.00 X $825.00 X $258.00 X X $2,331.77 $208.00
20) 12087 $1,162.00 X X X X $658.00 X X $1,127.77 $55.00
21) 00099 X X $350.00 $405.00 X X X $501.00 X $21.00
22) 12724 $764.00 $1,105.00 $650.00 X X X $300.00 X $1,131.77 $128.00
23) FM 1196 X X X X $75.00 X X X X $398.00




SALVAGE TABULATION

Specification Number: F2998940022 Date: November 25, 2002

Project Description: USED VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: $ NONE Addendum 1 2 3 4 Contract Administrator: J. Picl
NAME OF BIDDER PG. 1 Cozzi Iron
& Metal
1) FDD473 $300.00
2) FDD409 $300.00
3) FDD452 $300.00
4) FDD485 $300.00
5) FDD486 $300.00
6) FDE179 $300.00
7) FDE261 X
8) 12307 X
9) 10078 $200.00
10) 10079 $200.00
11) 10080 $100.00
12) 10081 $100.00
13) 10082 $100.00
14) 12039 $125.00
15) 12042 $100.00
16) 12052 $125.00
17) 12056 $80.00




SALVAGE TABULATION

Specification Number: F2998940022

Project Description: USED VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT

Date: November 25, 2002

Bid Deposit: $ NONE Addendum 1 2 3 4 Contract Administrator: J. Picl
18) 12058 $125.00
NAME OF BIDDER PG. 2 Cozzi Iron
& Metal
19) 12060 $125.00
20) 12087 $100.00
21) 00099 X
22) 12724 $125.00
23) FM 1196 $50.00

Bids are subject to review for completeness accuracy and compliance with all the terms and conditions provided in the bid specifications.
City of Chicago
Richard M. Daley, Mayor

Department of Procurement Services
David E. Malone Chief Procurement Officer




