

# SALVAGE TABULATION



Specification Number: F3998940010

Date: June 4, 2003

Project Description: FOR SALE, USED VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: \$ NONE

Addendum   1   2   3   4

Contract Administrator: J. Picl

NAME OF BIDDER	PG. 1	Hector A. Villatoro	Vintage Vehicles & Parts Inc.	Derby Hill Equipment	Richards Auto Sales	Minas Klikas	Tom McIntosh	Charles Malak	Georges Auto	Auto Wholesalers	T&B Cartage	Ideal Auto Ent. Inc.	ILYAS
EC0002		x	NO BID	NO BID	\$20.00	NO BID	x	x	x	NO BID	x	x	x
DT0036		x			\$51.00		x	x	x		x	x	x
GS0104		x			\$31.00		x	x	x		x	x	x
GS0122		x			\$31.00		x	x	x		x	x	\$468.00
PV0120		x			\$261.00		x	\$469.77	X		\$675.76	\$569.00	\$868.00
SO3513		x			\$35.00		x	x	x		x	x	x
SO3565		x			\$31.00		x	x	x		x	x	x
S13345		x			\$35.00		x	x	x		x	x	x
S13637		x			\$75.00		x	x	\$400.00		x	x	x
S13651		x			\$35.00		x	x	\$375.00		x	x	x
S14009		x			\$301.00		x	x	\$850.00		x	\$369.00	\$1,769.00
FM0121		x			\$21.00		x	x	x		x	x	x
FM2050		x			x		x	x	x		x	x	x
S13203		x			\$310.00		x	x	\$525.00		x	\$869.00	\$468.00
DT3802		x			\$201.00		x	x	\$1,200.00		\$976.52	\$1,269.00	\$578.00
FDA320		x			\$35.00		x	x	x		\$656.81	\$269.00	\$260.00
HS3413		x			\$75.00		x	x	\$325.00		x	x	\$359.00

# SALVAGE TABULATION



Specification Number: F3998940010

Date: June 4, 2003

Project Description: FOR SALE, USED VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: \$ NONE

Addendum   1   2   3   4

Contract Administrator: J. Picl

SO3528	x			\$31.00		x	x	x		x	x	x	
NAME OF BIDDER	PG. 2	Hector A. Villatoro	Vintage Vehicles & Parts Inc.	Derby Hill Equipment	Richards Auto Sales	Minas Klikas	Tom McIntosh	Charles Malak	Georges Auto	Auto Wholesalers	T&B Cartage	Ideal Auto Ent. Inc.	ILYAS
BH0100	x	NO BID	NO BID	\$31.00	NO BID	x	x	x	NO BID	x	x	x	
DT0038	x			\$35.00		x	x	X		x	x	x	
FDA387	x			\$126.00		\$239.50	X	X		x	\$369.00	x	
FDA391	x			\$101.00		\$189.75	x	X		x	\$369.00	x	
FDC919	x			\$265.00		x	x	X		\$648.45	X	x	
FDC936	x			x		x	x	X		x	x	x	
FDC939	x			x		x	x	X		x	x	x	
FM3051	x			\$51.00		x	x	X		x	x	x	
PN0003	\$400.00			\$35.00		x	x	X		x	\$469.00	\$668.00	
PV0071	x			\$101.00		x	x	X		x	\$469.00	\$468.00	
RVP929	\$300.00			\$106.00		x	x	\$460.00		x	\$369.00	x	
SO3314	x			\$20.00		x	x	X		x	x	\$168.00	
SO3510	x			\$35.00		x	x	X		x	x	x	
SO3515	x			\$35.00		x	x	X		x	x	x	
S13816	x			\$55.00		x	x	X		\$175.58	\$369.00	x	
S13262	x			\$210.00		x	x	\$600.00		\$851.32	\$469.00	\$778.00	



# SALVAGE TABULATION



Specification Number: F3998940010

Date: June 4, 2003

Project Description: FOR SALE, USED VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: \$ NONE

Addendum   1   2   3   4

Contract Administrator: J. Picl

NAME OF BIDDER	PG. 4	Patel Imtiyaz	Erickson Trucks-N- Parts	A-1 Services	John Szarek	A&M Auto	DMC Sales						
EC0002		x	x	x	x	x	x						
DT0036		x	x	x	x	x	x						
GS0104		x	x	x	x	x	x						
GS0122		x	\$327.00	X	x	x	x						
PV0120		x	\$127.00	\$857.00	X	\$776.00	X						
SO3513		x	\$127.00	x	x	\$150.00	x						
SO3565		x	x	x	x	x	x						
S13345		x	x	x	x	x	x						
S13637		x	\$107.11	x	x	\$405.00	x						
S13651		x	x	x	x	x	x						
S14009		\$2,000.00	\$207.00	x	x	\$1,326.00	x						
FM0121		x	x	x	x	x	x						
FM2050		x	x	x	x	x	x						
S13203		x	\$111.00	x	x	\$1,426.00	x						
DT3802		x	\$607.00	x	x	\$1,459.00	\$1,012.65						
FDA320		x	\$107.00	x	x	\$151.00	x						
HS3413		x	x	x	\$891.00	X	x						

# SALVAGE TABULATION



Specification Number: F3998940010

Date: June 4, 2003

Project Description: FOR SALE, USED VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: \$ NONE

Addendum   1    2    3  4

Contract Administrator: J. Picl

NAME OF BIDDER	PG. 5	Patel Imtiyaz	Erickson Trucks-N-Parts	A-1 Services	John Szarek	A&M Auto	DMC Sales						
SO3528		x	x	x	x	\$105.00	x						
BH0100		x	\$207.00	x	x	x	x						
DT0038		x	x	x	x	\$105.00	x						
FDA387		x	x	\$857.00	x	\$1,216.00	x						
FDA391		x	\$207.00	\$857.00	x	\$1,216.00	x						
FDC919		x	\$857.11	x	x	\$656.50	\$386.25						
FDC936		x	x	x	x	x	x						
FDC939		x	\$1,111.11	x	x	\$675.55	x						
FM3051		x	\$411.00	x	x	x	x						
PN0003		x	x	\$255.00	x	\$1,151.00	x						
PV0071		x	\$257.00	\$355.00	x	\$406.00	x						
RVP929		x	\$217.00	\$157.00	\$689.00	\$351.00	x						
SO3314		x	\$127.00	x	x	\$185.00	x						
SO3510		x	\$111.00	x	x	\$110.00	x						
SO3515		x	\$207.00	x	x	\$105.00	x						
S13816		x	\$407.00	x	x	x	x						
S13262		x	\$557.00	x	x	\$756.00	x						
DH0034		x	x	x	x	x	x						

# SALVAGE TABULATION



Specification Number: F3998940010

Date: June 4, 2003

Project Description: FOR SALE, USED VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: \$ NONE

Addendum   1  2  3  4

Contract Administrator: J. Picl

RV1000	x	x	x	x	\$481.50	x						
NAME OF BIDDER	Patel Imtiyaz	Erickson Trucks-N- Parts	A-1 Services	John Szarek	A&M Auto	DMC Sales						
PG. 6												
S12664	x	x	x	x	\$105.00	x						
S13206	x	x	x	x	\$1,558.00	x						

*Bids are subject to review for completeness accuracy and compliance with all the terms and conditions provided in the bid specifications.*

**City of Chicago**  
**Richard M. Daley, Mayor**

**Department of Procurement Services**  
**David E. Malone Chief Procurement Officer**