From: Conway, Daniel E. [mailto:Daniel.Conway@chicagopolice.org]

Sent: Tuesday, August 29, 2017 9:47 AM

To: Berlin, Steve

Subject: Travel

Mr. Berlin,

All travel to Washington DC has been completed and all expenses will be paid for by the Dept of Justice.

Thanks, Dan Conway

-----Original Message-----

From: Conway, Daniel E. [mailto:Daniel.Conway@chicagopolice.org]

Sent: Friday, August 04, 2017 9:36 AM

To: Berlin, Steve

Subject: Travel

Mr. Berlin,

I will be traveling out of state to Washington D.C. for and award ceremony on 23AUG17 - 25AUG17. All expenses will be paid for by the Dept of Justice.

Thanks,

 Dan Conway #6141

 Unit 193

 ATF Task Force

 312-533-0071

